
 

MONROE CITY SCHOOL BOARD 
MONROE, LOUISIANA 

BID PROPOSAL FORM - MC 26-02 

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 

 11:00 AM, TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 9, 2025 

 SPECIFICATION QTY CENTRAL 

POLY 

ECONOMICAL INTERBORO 

PACKAGING 
PYRAMID QUILL UNIPAK    

1 
Multipurpose Cleaning 

Towels 300 cs NO BID 33.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID    

2 Light Bulbs F32T8/841 200 cs NO BID 60.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID    
3 Bleach 150 cs NO BID 18.40 NO BID 24.99 37.11 NO BID    
4 Paper Towel 1016 cs 26.66 20.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID    
5 Toilet Tissue 600 cs 55.00 44.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID    

6 
High Speed Hog Hair Only 

Floor Pads 40 cs NO BID 12.89 NO BID 13.49 NO BID NO BID    

7 
3M 4100 Polishing Pad, 

Color White 60 cs NO BID 12.40 NO BID 13.45 NO BID NO BID     

8 
Pinnacle Lay Flat Rayon 
Mops, 16 Ounce 40 cs NO BID 44.40 NO BID 44.28 NO BID NO BID    

      

9 

  

 

Mop Handles 40 bundles of 6 NO BID 49.68 NO BID 51.96 NO BID NO BID    

10 
 

Long Handle Scrapers 3 dozen NO BID 165.00 NO BID 69.48 NO BID NO BID     

11 Splash Hog Urinal Screen  100 cs NO BID 63.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID     

12 
Single-Use Restroom and 

Bowl Liquid Concentrate 

Cleaner 
100 cs NO BID 45.58 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID    

13 Single-Use Packaging 

Window Cleaner and 

Stainless Steel Cleaner 

100 cs NO BID 26.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID    

14 
Stearns Air Freshener 

Package Cleaner 100 cs NO BID 14.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID    

15 Single-Use Package Citrus 

Neutral Cleaner 
150 cs NO BID 27.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID    

16 
Stearns #2308886 

Disinfectant, Germicidal 

Detergent and Deodorant 
Cleanerr 

50 cs NO BID 40.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID     

17 
 

Wax Stripper 
100 5 gallon 
containers NO BID 56.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID    

 



 

 

 

18 
Heavy Duty 35 Quart 

Plastic Bucket with 

Pressure Wringer 
30 sets NO BID 44.35 NO BID 51.98 NO BID NO BID    

19 Rubbermaid Long Handle 

Lobby Dust Pan 

 

15 each NO BID 6.39 NO BID 12.79 22.46 NO BID     

20 

Industrial Nitrile Gloves, 

Powder Free, 3-4 mil 
 

Medium 

 

Large 

 

Ex-Large 

 
 

100 cs 

 

 

100 cs 
 

 

100 cs 
 

 
 
 

NO BID 
 
 
 

29.13 
 
29.13 
 
29.13 

29.80 
 

29.80 
 

29.80 

29.50 
 

29.50 
 

29.50 

NO BID 

 
27.50 

 
27.50 

 
27.50 

 

   

21 
 

12” Angle Sweep Broom 3 dozen NO BID 40.20 NO BID 39.48 NO BID NO BID    

22 Classroom Wastebasket – 

7 Gallon, Plastic/14x10x15 

–Brown 

 

12 dozen  
NO BID 

 
47.40 

 
NO BID 

 
73.08 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

   

 
23 

 

 

Cellucap Bab-O Cleaner 

with Bleach, 21 oz., 

Pleasant, Powder (24 Per 

Case) 
20 cs NO BID 26.95 NO BID 37.98 NO BID 

 

 

 
NO BID    

 
 

24 

 

HID Bulb:  Universal 
Burning, ED17, Medium 

Screw (E26), 100W Watt, 

3000K, Metal Halide 

20 cs NO BID  132.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 
 
 

NO BID    

 
25 

 

Halco MH150/U HID 

Metal Halide Pulse Start 

ED27 Bulb E26 Base 
150W 

20 cs NO BID 133.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 
 
 

NO BID    

 
26 

 

Replacement Blades for 4” 

Handheld and Light Duty 

Floor Scrapers 
80 dozen NO BID 6.05 NO BID 4.99 NO BID  

 
 

NO BID    

MC26-02 


