
 

MONROE CITY SCHOOL BOARD 

    MONROE, LOUISIANA 

              BID PROPOSAL FORM – MC24-01 – INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES         

                                                                                                                 9:00 A.M. CST ON TUESDAY, JULY 11, 2023 

   

SPECIFICATION 

 

QTY 

 

CONTACT 

PAPER 

GROUP 

 

DISCOUNT 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY 

 

 

 

ECONOMICAL 

 

EXECUTIVE 

OFFICELINX 

 

NATIONAL 

ART & 

SCHOOL 

 

PEREGRINE 

 

PYRAMID 

 

S&S 

WORLDWIDE 

 

SUPERIOR 

TEXT 

 

TEACHERS 

PET 

 

TEACHERS 

MART  

 

SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY 

1. Pencils, No. 2 Soft (144/Box) 500 gross NO BID 31.49 NO BID 10.55 14.75 12.30 
11.95 NO BID 21.72 NO BID NO BID 12.80 

2. Dry-Erase Markers 

A.  Chisel Tip  

B.  Fine Tip (EXPO Vis-à-vis) 

 

1000 sets 

1000 sets 

 

NO BID 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

NO BID 

 

 

     NO BID 

NO BID 

 

 

2.00 

1.19 

 

2.30 

2.08 

 

 

2.46 

2.65 

 

1.49 

1.85 

 

 

NO BID 

NO BID 

 

 

5.26 

5.14 

 

 

NO BID 

NO BID 

 

  

2.27 

NO BID 

 

  

1.42 

2.78 

 

3. Multi Purpose Office Paper 

A.  Canary 

B. Goldenrod  

 C. Light Blue 

D.  Light Green 

E.  Light Pink  

F.  Orchid  

G.  Tan 

 

100 reams 

100 reams 

100 reams 

100 reams 

100 reams 

100 reams 

100 reams 

 

 

5.50 

5.50 

5.50 

5.50 

5.50 

5.50 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO  BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

 

 

 

7.59 

7.59 

7.59 

7.59 

7.59 

7.59 

8.51 

 

 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

 

 

10.06 

10.06 

10.06 

10.06 

10.06 

10.06 

11.59 

 

 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

 

 

17.31 

13.96 

11.98 

18.92 

14.22 

23.78 

12.60 

 

 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

 

 

6.84 

6.84 

6.84 

6.84 

6.84 

6.84 

NO BID 

4. Crayon, 16 count set 1000 sets NO BID 1.61 NO BID 1.71 .80 
1.83 

.46 1.36   1.52 1.27 NO BID .49 

5. Crayon, 8 count set 1000 sets NO BID .98 NO BID .85 .48 
.97 

.33 .71 2.38 .68 NO BID .32 

6. Scissors for Kids 5” 

 A.  Blunt  

 B.  Pointed 

 

500 ea 

500 ea 

 

NO BID 

NO BID 

 

.99 

NO BID 

. 

NO BID 

NO BID 

 

1.60 

1.60 

 

.52 

.52 

 

 

2.88 

2.88 

 

.45 

.45 

 

1.99 

1.99 

 

3.38 

6.28 

 

NO BID 

NO BID 

 

NO BID 

.NO BID 

 

.65 

.65 

7. Colored Pencil, 12 Count Box, 

Crayola or Equal 

500 boxes       NO BID NO BID NO BID 2.40 1.33 
          3.09 

.99 1.87 1.53 1.78 1.99 1.34 

8. Highlighters 1000 pk NO BID 3.17 NO BID 2.49 1.32  2.97 
1.59 NB 2.62 NO BID 1.75  .84 

9. 

 

Binder Clips 

A.  Mini size, 9/16 in 

 

 

 

600 boxes 

 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

 

.24 

 

 

 

  .24 

 

 

 

1.75 

 

 

 

.32 

 

 

 

    NO BID 

  

 

 

 

1.24 

 

 

 

 

    NO BID 

  

 

 

 

.39 

 

 

 

 

.22 

 

 



 

 

B.  Small Size, 3/4 in 

 

C.   Medium Size, 5/8 in 

 

600 boxes 

 

 

600 boxes 

 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

 

.33 

 

 

.68 

 

.30 

 

 

.52 

 

2.00 

 

 

3.10 

 

.30 

 

 

.59 

 

    NO BID 

 

 

 

    NO BID 

 

2.00 

 

 

 

1.87 

 

    NO BID 

 

 

 

    NO BID 

 

.45 

 

 

 

.99 

 

.23 

 

 

 

NO BID 

10. Pencil Pouch 1000 pouches 
 

NO BID 

 

.92 

 

 

NO BID 

 

1.97 

 

.98 

 

3.39 

 

.69 

 

NO BID 

 

NO BID 

 

NO BID 

 

1.09 

 

8.70 

11. Paper Towel 1000 rolls 
 NO BID 

 

NO BID .81 1.30 NO BID 4.08 NO BID  NO BID 

 

2.19 NO BID  NO BID 

 

.956 

12. Facial Tissue 500 bx 
NO BID 1.74 .77 .78 NO BID 2.79 .95 NO BID 2.96 NO BID NO BID 1.307 

13 Pocket Portfolio, Two Pocket 

Folders with Prongs 

1000 boxes 
NO BID NO BID NO BID 12.97 NO BID 18.00 9.29 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.03 

14. Binders, 1” Black Three Ring 1000 ea 

 

 

NO BID 

 

4.49 

 

NO BID 

 

 

 

2.69 

 

NO BID 

 

2.80 
 

1.79 

 

NO BID 

 

3.94 

 

2.98 

 

NO BID 

 

2.15 

15. Binders, 2” Three Ring 

A.  Black 

 

B.  White 

 

1000 ea 

 

1000 ea 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

3.64 

 

 

3.64 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

          NO 

BID 

 

 

3.82 

 

 

3.82 

 

 

2.39 

 

 

2.39 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

4.20 

 

 

4.20 

 

 

5.04 

 

 

5.04 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

3.23 

 

 

3.23 

16. Binders, 3” Three Ring 

A.  Black 

 

B.  White 

 

500 ea 

 

500 ea 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

5.00 

 

 

5.00 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

          NO 

BID 

 

 

5.49 

 

 

5.49 

 

 

3.69 

 

 

3.69 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

8.14 

 

 

8.14 

 

 

6.87 

 

 

6.87 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

NO BID 

 

 

4.96 

 

 

4.96 

 

17. Index Cards 4x6 200 pk 
NO BID NO BID NO BID 1.60 NO BID 1.48 .79 NO BID 2.60 NO BID NO BID .80 

18. Index Cards 3x5 200 pk 
NO BID 1.79 NO BID 1.00 NO BID .93 .42 NO BID 3.10 NO BID NO BID .45 

19. Carton Seal Tape (General 

Purpose) 

300 pk 
NO BID 24.74 NO BID 7.00 7.80 49.63 6.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 

NO BID 

20. Standard Staples 1000 pk 
NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.00 .57 .88 6.50 NO BID 1.82 NO BID 9.90 .58 

21. Glue Stick 1000 pk 
NO BID 36.00 NO BID 18.90 18.96 10.56 7.92 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 38.60 

22. School Glue, Washable 4 Ounce Size 166 packs 
NO BID 9.99 NO BID 1.59 8.88 27.84 9.48 15.96 NO BID NO BID 13.08 NO BID 

23. Wooden Imperial/Metric Ruler, 12” 2000 ea 
NO BID 15.66 NO BID .50 .28 .63 .30 NO BID 2.62 NO BID NO BID .23 

           

          MC24-01 

     


