
 

MONROE CITY SCHOOL BOARD 
MONROE, LOUISIANA 

BID PROPOSAL FORM - MC 23-02 

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 

 11:00 A.M. CST ON TUESDAY, JUNE 28, 2022 

 SPECIFICATION QTY CENTRAL 

POLY 

ECONOMICAL INTERBORO 

PACKAGING 
PARKER 

WHOLESALE 
PYRAMID TRONEX UNIPAK   

1 
Multipurpose Cleaning 

Towels 300 cs NO BID 31.45 NO BID 30.48 66.55 NO BID NO BID   

2 Light Bulbs F32T8/841 225 cs NO BID 52.10 NO BID 55.26 NO BID NO BID NO BID   
3 Bleach 899 cs NO BID 19.50 NO BID NO BID 20.69 NO BID NO BID   
4 Paper Towel 1000 cs 24.40 22.20 NO BID 23.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID   
5 Toilet Tissue 600 cs 49.55 38.30 NO BID 48.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID   

6 
High Speed Hog Hair Only 

Floor Pads 40 cs NO BID 12.24 NO BID NO BID 12.55 NO BID NO BID   

7 
Stripping Pads – High 

Performance 60 cs NO BID 11.28 NO BID NO BID 12.99 NO BID  NO BID   

8 
Bolt Cut 24 oz Screw On  
Mop Head 24 dz NO BID 46.30 NO BID 44.57 49.08 NO BID NO BID   

         
9  

Bolt Cut, 16 oz, Screw On 

Mop Head 46 dz NO BID 33.05 NO BID 31.91 35.88 NO BID NO BID   

10 
Pinnacle Lay Flat Rayon 

Mops 16 oz 20 cs NO BID 42.15 NO BID 40.66 45.36 NO BID  NO BID   

11 Pinnacle Mop Heads 24 oz  120 cs NO BID 59.60 NO BID 57.49 63.36 NO BID  NO BID   

12 Mop Handles 48 bundles of 6 NO BID 47.63 NO BID 45.94 50.52 NO BID NO BID   

13 Long Handle Scrapers 3 dz NO BID 77.40 NO BID 74.67 88.76 NO BID NO BID   

14 
 

Deluxe Buckets #55K1-14 qt 10 dz NO BID 72.60 NO BID NO BID 71.76 NO BID NO BID   

15 Genuine Joe Odor Control 

Urinal Screen Anti-Splash 
300 cs NO BID 15.20 NO BID NO BID 21.99 NO BID NO BID   

16 
Single-Use Restroom &  
Bowl Liquid Concentrate 

Cleaner 
100 cs NO BID 43.80 NO BID 42.25 NO BID  NO BID  NO BID   

17 
Single-Use Package Citrus 

Neutral Cleaner 100 cs NO BID  25.95 NO BID 25.03 NO BID  NO BID NO BID   

 

 

 



 

18 
Stearns #2308886 

Disinfectant, Germicidal 
Detergent and Deodorant 

Cleaner 
500 cs NO BID 36.65 NO BID 35.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID   

19 Wax Stripper 
150 -5 gal 

containers NO BID 72.43 NO BID 110.18 NO BID NO BID  NO BID   

20 
Heavy Duty 35 Quart  
Plastic Bucket with  
Pressure Wringer 

61 sets NO BID 47.59 NO BID  NO BID 55.98 NO BID NO BID   

21 
Rubbermaid Long Handle 

Lobby Dust Pan 60 ea NO BID 6.75 NO BID 8.33 6.98 NO BID NO BID   

22 Microfiber Duster with 

Extension Pole 

100 ea NO BID 36.65 NO BID 8.47 9.39 NO BID NO BID   

23 

Industrial Nitrile Gloves,  
Powder Free                          

Medium 

 

Large                     ……..      
 
XL                  

 

 

15 cs 
                                                                 “BIDS REJECTED” 125  cs 

125 cs 

 
24 

 

3M Scotch Brita Surface 

Prep Pad 

80 cs NO BID 79.15 NO BID NO BID 25.99 

 

 

NO BID NO BID   

 
 

25 

 

 

Round Container 45 
Gallon Brute 

50 ea NO BID  43.13 NO BID 64.58 31.98 

 

 

 

NO BID NO BID   

 
26 

 

Dolly (for 45 Gallon Brute 

Round Container) 

25 cs NO BID 44.78 NO BID 90.00 37.18 

 

 

NO BID NO BID   

 
27 

 

Trash Can:  Steel, Flat 

with an Open Top – Black  

15 Gallons 4 doz NO BID 2,039.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID  

 

 

NO BID NO BID   

28 Heavy Trash Bags, Low 

Density 1.3 MIL or 

Higher, Polyethylene Liner 

Coreless Roll 43 x 47, to 
fit 55-56 Gallon 

Containers, Gray 500 cs 29.00 25.30 22.84 24.45 NO BID 

 

 

 

NO BID 24.60   

 

MC23-02 


