MONROE CITY SCHOOL BOARD
MONRGOE, LOUISIANA
“BID PROPOSAL FORM”
SFS26-04 PAPER AND CLEANING SUPPLIES
9:00 A.M. CST ON TUESDAY, JUNE 10, 2025

ITEM | SPECIFICATION O | olYT | paxwai | FOMRECIL | INIERKORG | CPARKER. | o UNIPAK vee AOSS
100000 | Aproa, Bibbed 60 cs No Bid No Bid 3240 19.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.05 No Bid
100006 | Bag, Grocery Brown 64 75 cs No Bid No Bid 12.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.88 No Bid
100035 | Spork 1200 cs No Bid 6.87 6.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.35 No Bid
100038 | School Lunch Tray 5- 600 cs No Bid No Bid 2745 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.70 No Bid

Comparimeat
100044 | Aluminun Foil 18" Roll 3001l No Bid 3494 3050 No Bid 30.18 No Bid No Bid 3522 No Bid
100046 | PVC Film 18" Roll 10011 No Bid 16.75 1340 No Bid 12.56 No Bid No Bid 1525 No Bid
100048 | Pan Liners 16 3/8" x 24 3/8” 100 cs No Bid No Bid 41.73 No Bid 41.86 No Bid No Bid 46.60 No Bid
100062 | Paper Napkins, 10x 17 200 cs No Bid No Bid 46.33 No Bid 26.09 No Bid No Bid 137.51 No Bid
100108 | Bar Mep Towel 300 dz No Bid No Bid 5.14 No Bid 3.95 No Bid No Bid 36.06 No Bid
100131 | White Roll Towels 200 cs 32.00 No Bid 2727 No Bid 2936 No Bid No Bid 43.66 No Bid
100133 | Angular Sweep Broom 150 ca No Bid No Bid 4.06 No Bid No Bid 9.98 No Bid 10.34 3.13
160139 | Mulii-fold Hand Towels 300 ¢s 26.00 No Bid 21.62 No Bid 21.51 No Bid No Bid 19.52 50.00
160500 | Bleach 300 cs No Bid No Bid 1822 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.08 26.84
100525 | Industrial Nitrile Gloves 80 cs UPC/NPF

Large (40 cases) No Bid 31.33 39.25 32.00 No Bid 49.90 2750 30.00 68.00

Ex-Large {40 cases) No Bid 3133 3925 ey No Bid 49.90 27.50 30.00 68.00

SFS26-04QT




